
MetroTransit Police
Bus - Rail - Parking Lot - Metro Facilities - Others

Metro Transit Police Blotter

For : Tuesday, February 20, 2024

Date Time Disposition Location Rail Station Call Type Disposition Comments
02/20/2024 00:06:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4201 Ellin Rd NEWC SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 00:06:00 REPORT Sta New Carrollton Ent Rte 450 NEWC SUBJECT STOP FAIL TO PAY

02/20/2024 00:14:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4201 Ellin Rd NEWC SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 00:38:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 9000 Lottsford Rd DWNL SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 02:34:00 REPORT Georgia Ave NW / Peabody St NW - ASSAULT THREATS

02/20/2024 08:21:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 2700 Hamilton St WEHI SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 08:31:00 REPORT 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT THEFT THEFT 2

02/20/2024 08:41:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 5690 Eisenhower Ave VNDS SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 08:53:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 09:52:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 09:57:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 10:01:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 201 Galloway St NE - SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 10:04:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 3000 Pennsy Dr LAND SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 10:18:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 10:25:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 11:08:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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02/20/2024 11:09:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP F.T.P.

02/20/2024 12:22:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 7300 50th Ave CLGP SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 12:32:00 REPORT 9th St NW / Constitution Ave NW ARCH PROPERTYDESTRUCTION DESTR PROP

02/20/2024 13:08:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 5717 Greenbelt Metro Dr GNBT SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 13:17:00 ARREST 4230 Connecticut Ave NW VNNE FIGHT DISORDERLY AFFRAY

02/20/2024 13:42:00 ARREST 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP WARRANT SERVICE/PWID

02/20/2024 13:45:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 100 Addison Rd ADRD SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 14:03:00 ARREST 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP FUGITIVE FROM JUSTICE

02/20/2024 14:15:00 SUMMONS/CITATION Sta Glenmont Ent E GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 14:17:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 100 Addison Rd ADRD SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 14:40:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 14:52:00 ARREST 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP FTP / OBSTRUCTION OF JUSTICE

02/20/2024 15:02:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 15:05:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 15:09:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 15:14:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 100 Addison Rd ADRD SUBJECT STOP FTP

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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02/20/2024 15:20:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1911 Southern Ave SOAV SUBJECT STOP PUBLIC CONSUMPTION OF CDS

02/20/2024 15:22:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 15:24:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 15:27:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 100 Addison Rd ADRD SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 15:30:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 100 Addison Rd ADRD SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 15:50:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1911 Southern Ave SOAV SUBJECT STOP PUBLIC CONSUMPTION OF MARIJUANA

02/20/2024 16:01:00 ARREST 11171 Georgia Ave WHTN SUBJECT STOP APO / FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 16:38:00 REPORT 3030 14th St NW COLH THEFT THEFT OVER

02/20/2024 16:38:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT ASSAULT SECOND DEGREE ASSAULT

02/20/2024 16:49:00 ARREST 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 16:56:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 399 M St SW - SUBJECT STOP CIVIL CITATION

02/20/2024 16:57:00 REPORT 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT ROBBERY ATTEMPT ATTEMPT ROBBERY

02/20/2024 17:07:00 REPORT 5717 Greenbelt Metro Dr GNBT PROPERTYDESTRUCTION DESTRUCTION OF PROPERTY

02/20/2024 17:13:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP PUBLIC CONSUMPTION OF MARIJUANA

02/20/2024 17:15:00 ARREST 11171 Georgia Ave WHTN SUBJECT STOP POSSESSION OF CDS

02/20/2024 17:16:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 399 M St SW WTRF SUBJECT STOP CIVIL CITATION

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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02/20/2024 17:31:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 17:40:00 REPORT 145 Ike Dr - ASSAULT SIMPLE ASSAULT

02/20/2024 17:50:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 5717 Greenbelt Metro Dr GNBT THEFT THEFT UNDER

02/20/2024 17:55:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:01:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:04:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:07:00 ARREST 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:11:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:23:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1850 N Moore St RSLY SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:24:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1850 N Moore St RSLY SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:29:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 18:55:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP FARE EVAISON

02/20/2024 18:57:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4230 Fairfax Dr BALL SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 19:00:00 REPORT 1101 Howard Rd SE (garage Side) ANAC SUBJECT STOP DISORDERLY/FOOT PURSUIT

02/20/2024 19:12:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 19:14:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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02/20/2024 19:28:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 19:33:00 ARREST 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

02/20/2024 19:36:00 REPORT 2251 26th St NE - PROPERTYDESTRUCTION DESTRUCTION OF PROPERTY

02/20/2024 19:40:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 19:49:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1101 Howard Rd SE (garage Side) ANAC SUBJECT STOP PUBLIC CONSUMPTION OF MARIJUANA

02/20/2024 19:49:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 19:54:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 19:56:00 ARREST Texas Ave SE / E Capitol St SE BNRD THREATEN BODILY HARM THREATS

02/20/2024 20:07:00 ARREST 12501 Georgia Ave GLEN SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 20:08:00 ARREST 4500 Silver Hill Rd SUIT SUBJECT STOP FTP

02/20/2024 20:43:00 REPORT 7300 50th Ave CLGP THEFT THEFT UNDER

02/20/2024 23:25:00 ARREST 605 First St NE (mass Ave Side) UNST ASSAULT SIMPLE ASSAULT

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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