
MetroTransit Police
Bus - Rail - Parking Lot - Metro Facilities - Others

Metro Transit Police Blotter

For : Monday, April 14, 2025

Date Time Disposition Location Rail Station Call Type Disposition Comments
04/14/2025 00:23:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 6880 Frontier Dr FRSP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 00:39:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 6880 Frontier Dr FRSP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 00:43:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 6880 Frontier Dr FRSP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 01:37:00 REPORT Pennsylvania Ave SE / Minnesota Ave SE - BUS ACCIDENT W/INJURIES BUS ACCIDENT WITH INJURY

04/14/2025 01:42:00 REPORT Bladensburg Rd NE / T St NE - DISORDERLY SUBJECTS USE OF FORCE

04/14/2025 07:53:00 REPORT 2401 Mill Rd - SICK PERSON SICK PERSON TO THE HOSP

04/14/2025 08:08:00 REPORT 6880 Frontier Dr FRSP SICK PERSON SICK PERSON TO HOSP

04/14/2025 08:26:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 09:02:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 09:04:00 REPORT 10501 Rockville Pike GROS INJURED PERSON INJURED PERSON

04/14/2025 09:05:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 10:27:00 ARREST 100 Addison Rd S ADRD AREA CHECK AREA CHECK

04/14/2025 10:33:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 1st St NE UNST SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 10:39:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 1st St NE UNST SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

04/14/2025 10:40:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 1st St NE UNST SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

04/14/2025 10:52:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 11171 Georgia Ave WHTN SUBJECT STOP FTP

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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04/14/2025 10:53:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 11171 Georgia Ave WHTN SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

04/14/2025 10:54:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 3575 E West Hwy HYCR SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 10:58:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4120 Minnesota Ave NE MINA SUBJECT STOP FARE EVASION

04/14/2025 11:01:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 11171 Georgia Ave WHTN SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 11:08:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 1st St NE UNST SUBJECT STOP FARE EVSION

04/14/2025 11:32:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 3575 E West Hwy HYCR SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 11:38:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 1st St NE UNST SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 11:39:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1101 Howard Rd SE ANAC SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 11:45:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1101 Howard Rd SE ANAC SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 11:46:00 ARREST 1101 Howard Rd SE ANAC SUBJECT STOP WARRANT SERVICE/MISSING PERSON

04/14/2025 11:50:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 1st St NE UNST SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 12:00:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4120 Minnesota Ave NE MINA SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 12:05:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4120 Minnesota Ave NE MINA SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 12:27:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1200 Independence Ave SW SMIT SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 12:30:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 12:47:00 ARREST 1944 Chain Bridge Rd TYSN SMART TRIP INVESTIGATION CONCEALED WEAPON

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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04/14/2025 12:58:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 12:59:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4120 Minnesota Ave NE MINA SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:02:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:06:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:07:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4120 Minnesota Ave NE MINA SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:08:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:13:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:15:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:18:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1155 New Jersey Ave SE NYRD SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:22:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:24:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:36:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 13:54:00 REPORT 1300 Alabama Ave SE CONG ROBBERY FORCE ROBBERY FEAR

04/14/2025 14:00:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1701 8th St NW SHAW SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 14:23:00 REPORT 15903 Somerville Dr - AREA CHECK ATTEMPT TO LOCATE

04/14/2025 14:33:00 REPORT 1155 New Jersey Ave SE NYRD ASSAULT EMPLOYEE DISPUTE

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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04/14/2025 14:55:00 ARREST 1300 Alabama Ave SE CONG SUBJECT STOP MTP 2025-08488

04/14/2025 15:27:00 REPORT Calvert St NW / Biltmore St NW - FIGHT VERBAL DOMESTIC

04/14/2025 15:35:00 REPORT Route 200/ Exit 16-17 - ASSAULT DISTURBANCE ON METRO ACCESS BUS

04/14/2025 15:42:00 REPORT 705 Haary S.truman Dr N DWNL SUBJ WWEAPON SUSPICIOUS ACTIVITY

04/14/2025 16:47:00 ARREST 1902 N Sycamore St EAFC SUBJECT STOP FUGITIVE FROM JUSTICE

04/14/2025 17:37:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 3575 E West Hwy HYCR SUBJECT STOP SU

04/14/2025 17:50:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1252 S Hayes St PNTC SUBJECT STOP SU FTP

04/14/2025 18:14:00 ARREST 3575 E West Hwy HYCR SUBJECT STOP WARRANT SERVICE

04/14/2025 18:28:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 11171 Georgia Ave WHTN SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 18:43:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 4704 Old Soper Rd BRAV SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 18:44:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 300 7th St NW ARCH SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 18:45:00 ARREST 605 7th St NW GALP DISORDERLY SUBJECTS TRESPASSING

04/14/2025 18:52:00 ARREST 1902 N Sycamore St EAFC THEFT PETIT LARCENY/BURGLARIOUS TOOLS

04/14/2025 19:09:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 605 7th St NW GALP SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 19:10:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1300 Alabama Ave SE CONG SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 19:22:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 300 7th St NW ARCH SUBJECT STOP FTP

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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04/14/2025 19:53:00 REPORT New Jersey Ave NW / K St NW - PROPERTYDESTRUCTION DESTRUCTION OF PROP

04/14/2025 19:55:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1252 S Hayes St PNTC SUBJECT STOP SU

04/14/2025 19:57:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 1252 S Hayes St PNTC SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 20:16:00 REPORT Southern Ave SE / Southview Dr - BUS ACCIDENT W/INJURIES ASSIST LOCAL AGENCY

04/14/2025 20:17:00 ARREST 100 Addison Rd S ADRD ASSAULT ATTEMPT MURDER

04/14/2025 21:02:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 2 S Rotary Rd PENT SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 21:03:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 2 S Rotary Rd PENT SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 21:05:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 2 S Rotary Rd PENT SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 21:06:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 2 S Rotary Rd PENT SUBJECT STOP DIP

04/14/2025 21:08:00 ARREST 100 Addison Rd S ADRD SUBJECT STOP LOADED HANDGUN ON PERSON

04/14/2025 21:15:00 SUMMONS/CITATION 2 S Rotary Rd PENT SUBJECT STOP FTP

04/14/2025 22:30:00 ARREST 1701 8th St NW SHAW SUBJECT ON TRACKS TREPASS

** Metro Transit Police daily blotter reports show the time and location of arrests, reports and citations for a specified 24-hour period. Generally, reports are 
published every weekday, except holidays. Please note that blotter reports are not a comprehensive list of every police event, and information is based on initial 
reports made to MTPD. Follow-up investigations may reveal different or additional information. As a result, the classification of crimes may change as 
investigations are advanced. Please refer to crime statistics for official information. Incidents that occur aboard trains are reported from the nearest rail station.
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